

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
DISTRICT OF MINNESOTA
THIRD DIVISION

IN RE: GUIDANT CORP. IMPLANTABLE
DEFIBRILLATORS PRODUCT LIABILITY
LITIGATION

MDL NO. 1708
(DWF/AJB)

AUTHORIZATION TO PAY FEES AND EXPENSES
OF CLAIMS ADMINISTRATOR

The Special Master and Assistant Special Master authorized, direct and order, under the provisions of Section II A.4 of the Master Settlement Agreement, that the statement of Analytics Incorporated, dated May 12, 2008, which is attached hereto as Exhibit 1, be paid by the Escrow Agent out of the Settlement Fund Escrow Account (SFEA).

This 6th day of June, 2008.

s/ Arthur J. Boylan
ARTHUR J. BOYLAN
United States Magistrate Judge
Special Master
636 U.S. Courthouse
316 North Robert Street, Room 9E
St. Paul, MN 55101
Telephone: (651) 848-1210
Facsimile: (651) 848-1212

s/ Patrick A. Juneau
PATRICK A. JUNEAU, La. Bar #07594
Assistant Special Master
1018 Harding Street, Suite 202
Lafayette, Louisiana 70503
Telephone: (337) 269-0052
Facsimile: (337) 269-0061

Analytics Incorporated18750 Lake Drive East
Chanhassen, MN 55317*Invoice submitted to:*Patrick Juneau
Juneau Law Firm
1018 Harding Street
Suite 202
Lafayette LA 70503

May 12, 2008

In Reference To: Guidant MDL - (923.00)*Invoice #*4786

Professional Services

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/29/2008 Senior Management Conference call.	0.50 200.00/hr	100.00
Senior Management Conference call and follow up meeting.	0.50 200.00/hr	100.00
1/30/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	0.75 115.00/hr	86.25
2/1/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Receive, load and process data regarding class members.	1.75 115.00/hr	201.25
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	2.00 115.00/hr	230.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	8.00 115.00/hr	920.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Receive, load and process data regarding class members.	1.75 115.00/hr	201.25
2/3/2008 Project Management Update project processing plan.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
2/4/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	2.00 115.00/hr	230.00
Project Management Review counsel declaration forms and liaise with Zimmerman Reed regarding forthcoming data.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 2

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/4/2008 Project Management Review project status and incoming e-mail information.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Technical Configuration of interactive voice response system.	0.50 75.00/hr	37.50
2/5/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Prepare for and attend requirements and status meeting.	2.50 115.00/hr	287.50
Project Management Prepare for and attend requirements and status meeting.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Project Management Review data processing requirements.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
2/6/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	5.75 115.00/hr	661.25
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	3.00 115.00/hr	345.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	4.50 115.00/hr	517.50
Project Management Review and respond to case emails, review submitted documents.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
2/7/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	8.00 115.00/hr	920.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	6.75 115.00/hr	776.25
2/8/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	7.50 115.00/hr	862.50
2/11/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	6.25 115.00/hr	718.75
2/12/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	7.50 115.00/hr	862.50
Project Management Prepare for and attend teleconference.	0.75 125.00/hr	93.75
Systems Analyst/Programmer Conference call and follow up meeting.	0.75 115.00/hr	86.25
Senior Management Conference call and follow up meeting.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 3

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/12/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Conference call and follow up meeting.	0.75 115.00/hr	86.25
Systems Analyst/Programmer Conference call and follow up meeting.	0.75 115.00/hr	86.25
2/13/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	7.75 115.00/hr	891.25
2/14/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	4.75 115.00/hr	546.25
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	6.25 115.00/hr	718.75
2/15/2008 Project Management Review counsel declarations.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	4.00 115.00/hr	460.00
2/18/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	7.75 115.00/hr	891.25
2/19/2008 Project Management Review case documentation.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	8.50 115.00/hr	977.50
2/20/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	1.75 115.00/hr	201.25
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	7.50 115.00/hr	862.50
2/21/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	2.75 115.00/hr	316.25
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	8.75 115.00/hr	1,006.25
Project Management Coordinate and review updates to processing and reporting applications.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
2/22/2008 Project Management Prepare received counsel declaration forms for processing.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Project Management Train staff for processing counsel declaration forms.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 4

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/22/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	6.25 115.00/hr	718.75
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Project Management Review process with counsel and begin counsel declaration processing.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	2.00 115.00/hr	230.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
2/25/2008 Project Management Prepare received counsel declaration forms for processing.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	1.50 115.00/hr	172.50
Project Management Case meetings.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Project Management Compile reporting data.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Remove duplicates from attorney database.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Prepare counsel declaration forms for mailing.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
2/26/2008 Project Management Compile and transmit counsel declaration reports.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Prepare for and attend teleconference.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Prepare received counsel declarations for processing.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Train additional processing staff.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 5

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/26/2008 Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	2.25 115.00/hr	258.75
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	2.25 40.00/hr	90.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Project Management Update attorney information on database and participate in teleconference.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	2.25 40.00/hr	90.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	3.25 40.00/hr	130.00
2/27/2008 Project Management Prepare received counsel declaration forms for processing.	3.00 125.00/hr	375.00
Project Management Review, validate and update counsel/law firm contact information.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Review processing application.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	0.75 115.00/hr	86.25
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	3.50 115.00/hr	402.50
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	4.00 40.00/hr	160.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	2.15 40.00/hr	86.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 6

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/27/2008 Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	3.25 40.00/hr	130.00
Project Management Review counsel declaration forms.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
2/28/2008 Project Management Prepare received counsel declaration forms for processing.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	4.75 40.00/hr	190.00
Project Management Review, validate and update counsel/law firm contact information.	7.00 125.00/hr	875.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	4.00 40.00/hr	160.00
Project Management Follow up with Zimmerman Reed re: counsel declaration issues.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Update counsel declaration form reporting.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Coordinate updates to counsel contact details.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	3.25 40.00/hr	130.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	4.25 115.00/hr	488.75
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
2/29/2008 Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	2.25 40.00/hr	90.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	5.00 40.00/hr	200.00
Project Management Prepare received counsel declaration forms for processing.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	7.00 40.00/hr	280.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 7

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/29/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	4.50 115.00/hr	517.50
Project Management Manage counsel declaration form processing.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	2.50 40.00/hr	100.00
Accountant Tax filing and reporting for 2007.	1.75 125.00/hr	218.75
Project Management Review, validate and update counsel/law firm contact information.	3.50 125.00/hr	437.50
3/1/2008 Project Management Prepare counsel declaration forms for processing.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
3/3/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	6.75 115.00/hr	776.25
Project Management Prepare counsel declarations for processing.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Prepare counsel declaration forms for processing.	3.00 125.00/hr	375.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	2.25 40.00/hr	90.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	2.50 40.00/hr	100.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
3/4/2008 Project Management Prepare for and attend teleconference.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Prepare counsel declaration forms for processing.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	1.50 115.00/hr	172.50

Patrick Juneau

Page 8

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/4/2008 Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Project Management Review updated class member database and project plan.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Senior Management Conference call.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
Senior Management Conference call and follow up meeting.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
3/5/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	4.50 115.00/hr	517.50
Project Management Prepare counsel declaration forms for processing.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Coordinate and compare lists of declarations with outside counsel.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
3/6/2008 Project Management Research and respond to email submission issues.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Reconcile received declarations.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
3/7/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	3.00 115.00/hr	345.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	1.25 115.00/hr	143.75
Project Management Review counsel declaration forms.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Senior Management Call with Jeff Nelson.	0.75 200.00/hr	150.00
Project Management Research and respond to email display name issues.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Prepare counsel declaration forms for processing.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
3/10/2008 Project Management Review counsel declarations processing.	0.25 125.00/hr	31.25

Patrick Juneau

Page 9

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/10/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	1.75 115.00/hr	201.25
Project Management Manually flag duplicates in claimant data.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Reconcile and transmit reporting on received declarations.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
3/11/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	1.75 115.00/hr	201.25
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Project Management Manually match records between 2007 and 2008 databases.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Prepare for and attend teleconference.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Reconcile received declarations with counsel.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
3/12/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	4.00 115.00/hr	460.00
Project Management Coordinate and monitor staffing and processing levels.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Review of claimant and case data.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Senior Management Meeting with Zimmerman.	2.00 200.00/hr	400.00
Project Management Review and triage of processed counsel declarations.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Senior Management Meeting with Zimmerman.	2.00 200.00/hr	400.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	5.50 40.00/hr	220.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	4.75 40.00/hr	190.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 10

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/12/2008	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	6.75 40.00/hr	270.00
	Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	1.00 115.00/hr	115.00
	Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	1.25 115.00/hr	143.75
	Project Management Review project status with counsel.	0.25 125.00/hr	31.25
3/13/2008	Project Management Identify and remove duplicates from class data.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
	Project Management Review of processed counsel declarations.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
	Project Management Coordinate and monitor staffing and processing levels.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
	Project Management Coordinate and review counsel declarations for processing.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	2.25 40.00/hr	90.00
	Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	6.50 115.00/hr	747.50
	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	6.25 40.00/hr	250.00
	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	5.00 40.00/hr	200.00
	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	5.75 40.00/hr	230.00
3/14/2008	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	7.50 40.00/hr	300.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 11

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/14/2008 Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	8.00 40.00/hr	320.00
Senior Management Phone call with Pat Juneau.	0.25 200.00/hr	50.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	7.00 115.00/hr	805.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	7.00 40.00/hr	280.00
Project Management IT and data criteria meetings.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Training updates for processing staff.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Reconcile received counsel declarations and transmit list to counsel.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Coordinate and review counsel declarations for processing.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	4.50 115.00/hr	517.50
3/17/2008 Senior Management Meeting at Zimmerman/Reed to discuss processing procedures - draft outline of allocation of responsibilities.	2.00 200.00/hr	400.00
Senior Management Meeting at Zimmerman/Reed to discuss processing procedures.	2.00 200.00/hr	400.00
Senior Management Follow-up with Z/R re: disbursement of funds and requirements re: authorization	0.25 200.00/hr	50.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	4.00 40.00/hr	160.00
Project Management Reconcile received counsel declarations and transmit list to counsel.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	3.75 40.00/hr	150.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	6.00 40.00/hr	240.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 12

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/17/2008 Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	4.00 40.00/hr	160.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	5.75 115.00/hr	661.25
Project Management Review staff processing levels.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	6.75 40.00/hr	270.00
Project Management Coordinate and review counsel declarations for processing.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	2.00 115.00/hr	230.00
Project Management Review and triage of processed counsel declarations	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
3/18/2008 Senior Management Conference call with Jeff Nelson.	0.50 200.00/hr	100.00
Senior Management Conference call and follow up.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
Senior Management Conference call with Jeff Nelson.	0.50 200.00/hr	100.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	2.25 40.00/hr	90.00
Project Management Prepare for and attend teleconference.	1.75 125.00/hr	218.75
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Project Management Prepare for and attend teleconference.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	5.75 115.00/hr	661.25

Patrick Juneau

Page 13

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/18/2008	Project Management Coordinate review of duplicate declaration submissions.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
	Senior Management Conference call.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
3/19/2008	Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	5.00 115.00/hr	575.00
	Project Management Review case materials and draft proposed administration plan.	6.00 125.00/hr	750.00
	Project Management Develop processing plan.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	5.00 40.00/hr	200.00
3/20/2008	Project Management Finalize draft proposal administration plan.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
	Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	0.75 115.00/hr	86.25
	Project Management Develop processing plan	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	6.75 40.00/hr	270.00
3/21/2008	Project Management Processing third party lien Information.	4.00 125.00/hr	500.00
	Project Management Review received items in Guidant mailbox.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
	Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	0.25 115.00/hr	28.75
	Project Management Review third party liens.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
	Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	6.75 40.00/hr	270.00
3/24/2008	Senior Management Email to Z/R and SHB re: Joint Written Notice.	0.25 200.00/hr	50.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 14

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/24/2008 Project Management Work with IT on updates to processing system.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Test outside access of system.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Review claimant filed emails.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
3/25/2008 Project Management Review case materials.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Prepare for and attend teleconference.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Senior Management Conference call and follow up.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
Project Management Prepare for and attend teleconference.	1.25 125.00/hr	156.25
Senior Management Conference call.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
3/26/2008 Project Management Review case scope proposal.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Coordinate and fed-ex materials for Special Masters' system access.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
3/27/2008 Project Management Meeting to discuss asset requirements.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Senior Management Email to Z/R re: final list of eligible claimants. Draft and email to Z/R draft workflow and deliverables.	4.00 200.00/hr	800.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	7.25 115.00/hr	833.75
Project Management Review case scope proposal.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
3/28/2008 Project Management Meeting to establish personnel requirements.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 15

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/28/2008 Senior Management Email to Z/R and Wells Fargo re: investment of funds - change in investment vehicle.	0.25 200.00/hr	50.00
Project Management Meeting regarding staffing & equipment needs.	0.75 125.00/hr	93.75
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	2.50 40.00/hr	100.00
Project Management Review project definitions and project planning.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Project Management Case scope and planning meeting.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	0.50 115.00/hr	57.50
Senior Management Meeting to discuss requirements for claim validation.	0.75 150.00/hr	112.50
Project Management Meeting with Senior Management to discuss requirements for claim validation.	0.75 125.00/hr	93.75
3/31/2008 Project Management Research and respond to claimant questions.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
4/1/2008 Project Management Prepare for and attend weekly phone conference.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Senior Management Conference call.	0.75 200.00/hr	150.00
Project Management Reporting on deceased claimants.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Senior Management Analysis of deceased by state reporting.	0.25 200.00/hr	50.00
Project Management Plan required system updates.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Senior Management Conference call and follow up.	0.75 200.00/hr	150.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 16

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/1/2008 Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Senior Management Follow-up with staff re: draft deliverables. Analysis re: deceased by state. Forward to LCC and SHB.	2.00 200.00/hr	400.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	2.50 115.00/hr	287.50
4/2/2008 Project Management Conduct training session.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development and programming.	3.50 115.00/hr	402.50
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Claims Processing Process counsel declaration forms.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
4/3/2008 Project Management Conduct training session.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	2.50 115.00/hr	287.50
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.00 40.00/hr	160.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 17

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/3/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
4/4/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Receive, load and process data regarding class members.	1.25 115.00/hr	143.75
Project Management Quality review of claims processing.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Conduct training session.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.75 40.00/hr	190.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	6.00 40.00/hr	240.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.00 40.00/hr	280.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	3.00 125.00/hr	375.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.00 40.00/hr	280.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.75 40.00/hr	150.00
4/7/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Preparation of data regarding evaluation of claims.	4.25 115.00/hr	488.75
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.75 40.00/hr	110.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 18

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/7/2008 Project Management Prepare for and attend phone conference on workflow.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Project Management Examination of updated claim data.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Communicate deliverables to IT.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Conduct training session.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.15 40.00/hr	206.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	4.00 125.00/hr	500.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.50 40.00/hr	220.00
Senior Management Conference call.	0.75 200.00/hr	150.00
Senior Management Conference call with Elizabeth Peterson to discuss claims.	0.75 200.00/hr	150.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
Project Management Prepared staffing and workstation requirements	1.25 125.00/hr	156.25
4/8/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.00 40.00/hr	280.00
Project Management Prepare for and attend phone conference on workflow.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 19

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/8/2008 Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Project Management Review updated source data.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Conduct training session.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Senior Management Preparation for meeting. Emails to Defendants and LCC re: Garretson and Wells Fargo invoices.	6.00 200.00/hr	1,200.00
Senior Management Conference call.	0.75 200.00/hr	150.00
Senior Management Conference call and follow up.	0.75 200.00/hr	150.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.50 40.00/hr	220.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Preparation of data regarding evaluation of claims.	4.25 115.00/hr	488.75
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.50 40.00/hr	300.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	1.25 115.00/hr	143.75
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.50 40.00/hr	220.00
Project Management Prepared staffing and workstation requirements	1.75 125.00/hr	218.75
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 20

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/8/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.25 40.00/hr	210.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	4.00 125.00/hr	500.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
4/9/2008 Project Management Draft and coordinate attorney email campaign.	3.00 125.00/hr	375.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	6.25 115.00/hr	718.75
Systems Analyst/Programmer Preparation of data regarding evaluation of claims.	6.50 115.00/hr	747.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.75 40.00/hr	190.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.75 40.00/hr	230.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.75 40.00/hr	230.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Project Management Provide updated reporting and data to support St. Paul meeting.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	6.25 40.00/hr	250.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.25 40.00/hr	210.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.50 40.00/hr	300.00
Project Management Meeting with counsel re: direction of case and deliverables.	6.00 125.00/hr	750.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 21

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/9/2008 Senior Management Meeting re: Guidant MDL.	6.00 200.00/hr	1,200.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.75 40.00/hr	190.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.25 40.00/hr	290.00
Senior Management Follow-Up to Meeting re: Guidant MDL - Process and Plans re: Releases and Final Documents.	3.50 200.00/hr	700.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	6.75 40.00/hr	270.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.75 40.00/hr	230.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload and prepare for email reminder mailing.	4.50 125.00/hr	562.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.50 40.00/hr	300.00
4/10/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.50 40.00/hr	220.00
Project Management Examine and verify updated claimant list by comparing sources.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	6.00 40.00/hr	240.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	4.00 125.00/hr	500.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 22

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/10/2008 Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	5.00 115.00/hr	575.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.75 40.00/hr	150.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.50 40.00/hr	100.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.25 40.00/hr	130.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.50 40.00/hr	220.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.75 40.00/hr	310.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
4/11/2008 Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	3.00 125.00/hr	375.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.75 40.00/hr	150.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	4.50 115.00/hr	517.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	6.50 40.00/hr	260.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.00 40.00/hr	200.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	6.00 40.00/hr	240.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 23

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/11/2008 Project Management Draft updated attorney email format.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
4/14/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.25 40.00/hr	290.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.75 40.00/hr	110.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload and review email reminders.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	1.75 115.00/hr	201.25
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.75 40.00/hr	190.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Project Management Draft updated attorney email format.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
4/15/2008 Project Management Prepare for and attend phone conference on workflow.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Senior Management Conference call and follow up.	0.75 200.00/hr	150.00
Senior Management Conference Call.	0.75 200.00/hr	150.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 24

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/15/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.00 40.00/hr	160.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
4/16/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.25 40.00/hr	130.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	0.75 115.00/hr	86.25
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
4/17/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.75 40.00/hr	110.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.50 40.00/hr	100.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 25

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/18/2008	Project Management	1.00	125.00
	Prepare submitted documents for upload.	125.00/hr	
	Claims Processing	3.00	120.00
	Process received case materials.	40.00/hr	
	Claims Processing	3.75	150.00
	Process received case materials.	40.00/hr	
	Claims Processing	1.75	70.00
	Process received case materials.	40.00/hr	
	Claims Processing	4.00	160.00
	Process received case materials.	40.00/hr	
4/21/2008	Claims Processing	2.50	100.00
	Process received case materials.	40.00/hr	
	Claims Processing	2.00	80.00
	Process received case materials.	40.00/hr	
	Claims Processing	7.25	290.00
	Process received case materials.	40.00/hr	
	Senior Management	0.50	100.00
	Financial Reporting - distribution of Juneau invoice.	200.00/hr	
	Project Management	1.50	187.50
	Prepare submitted documents for upload.	125.00/hr	
	Claims Processing	2.00	80.00
	Process received case materials.	40.00/hr	
	Claims Processing	3.00	120.00
	Process received case materials.	40.00/hr	
4/22/2008	Claims Processing	3.50	140.00
	Process received case materials.	40.00/hr	
	Claims Processing	3.25	130.00
	Process received case materials.	40.00/hr	
	Senior Management	0.75	150.00
	Conference call and follow up.	200.00/hr	
	Claims Processing	3.75	150.00
	Process received case materials.	40.00/hr	
	Project Management	2.00	250.00
	Prepare submitted documents for upload.	125.00/hr	

Patrick Juneau

Page 26

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/22/2008 Project Management Prepare for and attend phone conference.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Senior Management Conference call and follow up.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Senior Management Conference call.	0.75 200.00/hr	150.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
4/23/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.75 40.00/hr	150.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Project Management Coordinate email to Plaintiffs' Counsel.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	0.50 115.00/hr	57.50
4/24/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
Project Management Liaise with client re: received materials report.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Coordinate email to Plaintiffs' Counsel.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Project Management Update received email submissions.	0.25 125.00/hr	31.25

Patrick Juneau

Page 27

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/24/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.25 40.00/hr	210.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.25 40.00/hr	90.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Generation of materials report.	3.00 115.00/hr	345.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.50 40.00/hr	220.00
4/25/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.25 40.00/hr	290.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.75 40.00/hr	190.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Generate reports.	0.75 115.00/hr	86.25
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	3.50 125.00/hr	437.50
Project Management Respond to Plaintiffs' Counsel requests for information / confirmation.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
4/28/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	3.50 125.00/hr	437.50

Patrick Juneau

Page 28

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/28/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Project Management Discuss data transfer with Garrettson firm and update Guidant submission mailbox.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.00 40.00/hr	200.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.75 40.00/hr	190.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.50 40.00/hr	220.00
4/29/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.00 40.00/hr	200.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Project Management Prepare for and attend phone conference.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.00 40.00/hr	280.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.25 40.00/hr	210.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 29

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/29/2008 Project Management Prepare submitted documents for processing.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Generate materials report.	0.75 115.00/hr	86.25
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.00 40.00/hr	160.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.75 40.00/hr	230.00
4/30/2008 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.25 40.00/hr	130.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.50 40.00/hr	220.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	6.25 40.00/hr	250.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
Project Management Prepare submitted documents for upload.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.75 40.00/hr	150.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
For professional services rendered	1304.80	\$100,332.00

Patrick Juneau

Page 30

Additional Charges :

	<u>Amount</u>
2/1/2008 Gray Plant Moody: Evaluation of Escrow Agreement.	2,937.00
2/24/2008 IVR Charges for 800 toll free numbers - February 2008 \$100 minimum	100.00
3/17/2008 Postage from Analytics Postage Meter to mail tax forms.	0.82
3/26/2008 Fed Ex to Patrick Juneau	12.16
Fed Ex to Magistrate Arthur Boylan	20.56
3/31/2008 Live Customer Service Agent support for class through March 2008 - 14 minutes @ \$1 per min.	14.00
IVR Charges for 800 toll free numbers - March 2008 \$100 minimum	100.00
4/18/2008 Fed Ex to Scott Dupree/Shook Hardy & Bacon	22.02
4/30/2008 IVR Charges for 800 toll free numbers - April 2008 \$100 minimum	100.00
Total costs	\$3,306.56
Total amount of this bill	\$103,638.56
Previous balance	\$25,611.44
4/7/2008 Payment - Thank You	(\$25,611.44)
Total payments and adjustments	(\$25,611.44)
Balance due	\$103,638.56