

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT  
DISTRICT OF MINNESOTA  
THIRD DIVISION

IN RE: GUIDANT CORP. IMPLANTABLE  
DEFIBRILLATORS PRODUCT LIABILITY  
LITIGATION

MDL NO. 1708  
(DWF/AJB)

\*\*\*\*\*

AUTHORIZATION TO PAY FEES AND EXPENSES  
OF CLAIMS ADMINISTRATOR

The Special Master and Assistant Special Master authorized, direct and order, under the provisions of Section II A.4 of the Master Settlement Agreement, that the statement of Analytics Incorporated for time and expenses incurred, dated April 15, 2009, which is attached hereto as Exhibit 1, be paid by the Escrow Agent out of the Settlement Fund Escrow Account (SFEA).

This 17<sup>th</sup> day of April, 2009.

s/ Arthur J. Boylan  
ARTHUR J. BOYLAN  
United States Magistrate Judge  
Special Master  
636 U.S. Courthouse  
316 North Robert Street, Room 9E  
St. Paul, MN 55101  
Telephone: (651) 848-1210  
Facsimile: (651) 848-1212

s/ Patrick A. Juneau  
PATRICK A. JUNEAU, La. Bar #07594  
Assistant Special Master  
1018 Harding Street, Suite 202  
Lafayette, Louisiana 70503  
Telephone: (337) 269-0052  
Facsimile: (337) 269-0061

# Analytics Incorporated

18750 Lake Drive East  
Chanhassen, MN 55317

---

---

*Invoice submitted to:*

Patrick Juneau  
Juneau Law Firm  
1018 Harding Street  
Suite 202  
Lafayette LA 70503

April 15, 2009

*In Reference To:* Guidant MDL - (923.00)

*Invoice #*5053

Professional Services

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/1/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
3/2/2009 Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Project Management Conference call with Garretson Firm and follow up data handling.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Coordinate preparation of third distribution.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
3/3/2009 Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	1.25 125.00/hr	156.25
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50

---

---

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/3/2009 Project Management Coordinate preparation of third distribution.	0.75 125.00/hr	93.75
Project Management Provide information for financial reporting.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Accountant Distribution support, account management and reconciliation.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
3/4/2009 Systems Analyst/Programmer Check programming and application support.	1.25 115.00/hr	143.75
Project Management Coordinate preparation of third distribution.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Systems Analyst/Programmer Check programming and application support.	1.75 115.00/hr	201.25
Accountant Distribution support, account management and reconciliation.	4.00 125.00/hr	500.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
3/5/2009 Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.75 125.00/hr	93.75

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/5/2009 Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Check programming and application support.	4.00 115.00/hr	460.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.75 40.00/hr	150.00
Project Management Coordinate preparation of third distribution.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
3/6/2009 Project Management Coordinate preparation of third distribution.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Accountant Distribution support, account management and reconciliation.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Check programming and application support.	1.50 115.00/hr	172.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Systems Analyst/Programmer Check programming and application support.	5.00 115.00/hr	575.00
3/8/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
3/9/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	1.75 115.00/hr	201.25
Project Management Review of third distribution data / submit report to client for approval.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Project Management Review and transmit report of uncashed checks.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/9/2009 Systems Analyst/Programmer Check programming and application support.	1.00 115.00/hr	115.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
3/10/2009 Senior Management Conference call and follow-up	0.75 200.00/hr	150.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	0.75 125.00/hr	93.75
Senior Management Conference call and follow-up	1.25 200.00/hr	250.00
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
3/11/2009 Project Management Liaise with defense counsel re: external access issues.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Review and implementation of holdback and other changes initiated by PSC.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	2.75 125.00/hr	343.75
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/11/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.75 40.00/hr	110.00
3/12/2009 Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Final review of implemented distribution report.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Systems Analyst/Programmer Check programming and application support.	2.75 115.00/hr	316.25
Technical Format and program re-issued checks.	0.50 75.00/hr	37.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	4.00 40.00/hr	160.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
3/13/2009 Project Management Print and review of third check distribution.	3.50 125.00/hr	437.50
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	1.00 115.00/hr	115.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/13/2009 Technical Format and program checks for distribution.	3.25 75.00/hr	243.75
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	2.25 125.00/hr	281.25
Systems Analyst/Programmer Check programming and application support.	3.00 115.00/hr	345.00
3/16/2009 Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Final review and mailing of check distribution.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.75 40.00/hr	110.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Project Management Prepare for and attend conference call.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
3/17/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.25 40.00/hr	90.00
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Verify delivery of checks by fed-ex.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/17/2009 Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
3/18/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	1.25 125.00/hr	156.25
Project Management Verify delivery of checks by fed-ex.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
3/19/2009 Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
3/20/2009 Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/20/2009	Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
	Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
	Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00
	Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.75 125.00/hr	93.75
3/23/2009	Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
	Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
	Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
	Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
	Accountant Distribution support, account management and reconciliation.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
	Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims	1.25 125.00/hr	156.25
3/24/2009	Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
	Project Management Prepare for and attend conference call.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
	Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
	Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
3/25/2009	Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
	Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
	Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	0.75 125.00/hr	93.75

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/25/2009 Project Management Process check reissues.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
3/26/2009 Technical Format and program re-issued checks.	2.25 75.00/hr	168.75
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.75 125.00/hr	93.75
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
3/27/2009 Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
3/28/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
3/30/2009 Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	0.75 125.00/hr	93.75
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
3/31/2009 Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/31/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Project Management Review and release of reissue checks.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Liaise with Garretson firm re: lien data.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Liaise with the parties regarding claim issues and tracking.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
<b>For professional services rendered</b>	<b>180.75</b>	<b>\$15,902.50</b>
Additional Charges :		
2/20/2009 Fed Ex to Kristin Lucey @ Gillin Jacobson Ellis & Larsen		20.18
Fed Ex to Reshonda Bradford @ Singleton Law Firm		19.13
Fed Ex to Ashley Cranford @ Whatley Drake & Kallas, LLC		19.13
Fed Ex to J Rice Ferrelle, Jr @ Murphy & Anderson PA		29.27
Fed Ex to Chris Coleman @ Lieff Cabraser Heimann		20.18
Fed Ex to Michael Goetz @ Morgan & Morgan PA		19.27
Fed Ex to Patrick Mulligan @ Mulligan Law Firm		19.13
Fed Ex to David Peterson @ Peterson & Associates PC		18.13
Fed Ex to Theresa Walsh @ Brown Chiari LLP		19.13
3/2/2009 Postage from Analytics Postage Meter to mail claimant materials for attorneys.		0.84
3/16/2009 Fed Ex to Heather Foster @ Lieff Cabraser Heimann		20.48
Fed Ex to Kenneth Allen @ Kenneth J Allen & Associates		18.40
Fed Ex to Kimberly Lambert & Levin, Papantonio, et al		22.02
Fed Ex to Debra DeCarli @ Levin, Simes, Kaiser & Gornick		20.48
Fed Ex to Lawrence Kullman @ Lewis, Kullman & Sterbcow		19.56
Fed Ex to Silvija Strikis @ Kellog, Huber, Hansen, Todd		19.41

	<u>Amount</u>
3/16/2009 Fed Ex to Steve Skikos @ Lopez Hodes	20.48
Fed Ex to Michael J Tosick @ Michael J Tosick, Attorney at Law	20.04
Fed Ex to Michael Goetz @ Morgan & Morgan, PA	19.56
Fed Ex to Rhett Klock @ Motley Rice LLC	19.56
Fed Ex to Patrick Mulligan @ Mulligan Law Firm	28.87
Fed Ex to Robert Joyce @ Joyce & Reyes, PA	19.56
Fed Ex to Joseph Walsh III @ Joseph Walsh III, Esq	18.40
Fed Ex to Kathryn Harrington @ Hollis, Wright & Harrington PC	21.35
Fed Ex to William Bross @ Heninger Garrison Davis, LLC	21.35
Fed Ex to R Galex @ Galex Wolf, LLC	19.41
Fed Ex to Joe Poirot @ Ferrer Poirot & Wansbrough	19.41
Fed Ex to Michael A London @ Douglas & London PC	19.41
Fed Ex to Jon Conlin @ Cory, Watson, Crowder & DeGari	19.41
Fed Ex to Andrew Lampros @ Cook, Hall & Lampros	19.41
Fed Ex to Irwin Levin @ Cohen & Malad, LLP	18.40
Fed Ex to Scott Levensten @ The Levensten Law Firm, PC	19.41
Fed Ex to Colleen Dolcy @ Fuggi & Fuggi, PC	19.41
Fed Ex to Jeremy Fietz @ Edgar Law Firm	20.48
Fed Ex to Steven Resnick @ Barroway Topaz & Kessler	19.41
Fed Ex to Paula Bliss @ Bubalo, Hiestrand & Rotman, PLC	18.40
Fed Ex to Michelle A Parfitt @ Ashcraft & Gerel LLP	19.41
Fed Ex to Russell T Abney @ Watts Law Firm, LLP	19.56
Fed Ex to Teresa Toriseva @ Toriseva Law	19.41
Fed Ex to Barry Weiss @ Topper & Weiss, LTD	18.40
Fed Ex to Michael Schmidt @ The Schmidt Law Firm	19.41

	<u>Amount</u>
3/16/2009 Fed Ex to Barry Levy @ OConnor, Acciani & Levy	18.40
Fed Ex to Brian J Malloy @ The Brandi Law Firm	20.48
Fed Ex to J Preston Strom Jr @ Strom Law Firm	19.41
Fed Ex to Anthony Laizure @ Stipe Harper Laizure Uselton	18.40
Fed Ex to Claudin Homolash @ Sheller PC	19.41
Fed Ex to Christopher A Seeger @ Seeger Weiss LLP	19.41
Fed Ex to Karen Schaeffer @ Robinson Calcagnie & Robinson	20.48
Fed Ex to Robert W Kerpsack @ Robert W Kerpsack Co, LPA	18.40
Fed Ex to Adam Pulaski @ Pulaski & Middleman, LLC	19.56
Fed Ex to Geoffrey Gifford @ Pavalon, Gifford, Laatsch	18.40
Fed Ex to Kara Jansen Zitnick @ Barry V Voss, PA	12.86
Fed Ex to Wil Florin @ Florin Roegib	19.56
Fed Ex to David Kleczek @ Kleczek Law Office	20.48
Fed Ex to Stuart Talley @ Kershaw, Cutter & Ratinoff, LLC	20.48
Fed Ex to Houston Gascon @ Houston C Gascon, Esq	21.87
Fed Ex to Lee Hollis @ Hollis Law Firm	18.40
Fed Ex to David Friend @ Hissey Kientz LLP	21.96
Fed Ex to Kristie Hanson @ Hanson Law Firm	19.41
Fed Ex to Michael Johnson @ Goldenburg & Johnson	12.86
Fed Ex to Richard A Freese @ Freese & Goss PLLC	19.41
Fed Ex to Safa Hodges @ Law Offices of Safa V Hodges	20.48
Fed Ex to Walter C Dumas @ Dumas & Assoc.	19.41
Fed Ex to Joseph G Sauder @ Chimicles & Tikellis, LLP	19.41
Fed Ex to David P Hersh @ Burg, Simpson, Eldredge, Hersh	19.41
Fed Ex to Neil Overholtz @ Aylstock, Witkin, Kreis	19.56

	<u>Amount</u>
3/16/2009 Fed Ex to William M Audet @ Audet and Partners LLP	20.48
Fed Ex to Thomas Anapol @ Anapol Schwartz Weiss Cohan	29.41
Fed Ex to Alex Alvarez @ Alvarez Law Firm	20.48
Fed Ex to Ronald Rash @ Aaronson & Rash PLLC	19.56
Fed Ex to Charles Johnson @ Charles H Johnson & Associates	12.86
Fed Ex to Debra Hayes @ Reich & Binstock	19.56
Fed Ex to James T Capretz @ Capretz & Associates	20.48
Fed Ex to Ted Meadows @ Beasley Allen	19.41
Fed Ex to Frederick Bostwick III @ Beard, Kultgen, Bostwick	19.41
Fed Ex to Ronald Goldser @ Zimmerman Reed, PLLP	12.86
Fed Ex to Ashley Cranford @ Whatley Drake & Kallas, LLC	19.41
Fed Ex to David Rosenband @ Weitz & Luxenberg, PC	19.41
Fed Ex to Mike Davis @ Slack & Davis, LLP	19.56
Fed Ex to Marc D Grossman @ Sanders Viener Grossman, LLP	19.56
Fed Ex to Scott Kogen @ Law Office of Scott A Kogen	18.40
Fed Ex to David Peterson @ Peterson & Associates, PC	18.40
Fed Ex to Richard Arsenault @ Neblett Beard & Arsenault	21.35
Fed Ex to J Rice Ferrelle Jr @ Murphy & Anderson, PA	29.56
Fed Ex to Kirk Chapman @ Milberg LLP	19.41
Fed Ex to Michael Hingle @ Michael Hingle & Associates	19.41
Fed Ex to David Matthews @ Matthew & Associates	19.56
Fed Ex to Martin Franey @ Martin Franey, Attorney at Law	19.41
Fed Ex to Matthew Lundy @ Lundy & Davis	19.41
3/20/2009 Postage from Analytics Postage Meter to mail checks.	3.36
3/31/2009 Automated toll free phone charges - March 2009. \$100 per month minimum.	100.00

	<u>Amount</u>
3/31/2009 Fax expense - March 2009 6 @ \$1.00/ea.	0.60
Print checks for additional distribution - 245 checks @ \$0.50 ea.	122.50
Copies - March 2009 - 14 @ \$0.15 ea.	2.10
<b>Total costs</b>	<hr/> <b>\$1,966.49</b>
<b>Total amount of this bill</b>	<hr/> <b>\$17,868.99</b>
<b>Previous balance</b>	<b>\$22,861.52</b>
3/20/2009 Payment - Thank You.	(\$22,861.52)
<b>Total payments and adjustments</b>	<hr/> <b>(\$22,861.52)</b>
Balance due	<hr/> <b>\$17,868.99</b> <hr/>