

## Analytics Incorporated

18750 Lake Drive East  
Chanhassen, MN 55317

Invoice submitted to:  
Patrick Juneau  
Juneau Law Firm  
1018 Harding Street  
Suite 202  
Lafayette LA 70503

February 17, 2009

In Reference To: Guidant MDL - (923.00)

Invoice #4989

### Professional Services

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/2/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	5.25 40.00/hr	210.00
Project Management Distribution follow up.	3.50 125.00/hr	437.50
1/5/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	4.75 125.00/hr	593.75
Systems Analyst/Programmer Check programming and application support.	1.50 115.00/hr	172.50
Systems Analyst/Programmer Check programming and application support.	0.25 115.00/hr	28.75
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	3.50 125.00/hr	437.50
Project Management Liaise with Garretson Firm regarding MLA email.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Prepare training materials for management of post-distribution calls from submitting counsel.	1.25 125.00/hr	156.25

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/5/2009 Systems Analyst/Programmer Check programming and application support.	0.50 115.00/hr	57.50
Project Management Management of Medicare/Medicaid holdback process.	1.25 125.00/hr	156.25
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
Technical Format and program checks for distribution.	1.00 75.00/hr	75.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.25 40.00/hr	210.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	3.00 125.00/hr	375.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
1/6/2009 Distribution Services Distribution processing.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	5.75 125.00/hr	718.75
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	0.75 115.00/hr	86.25
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Project Management Coordinate MLA email project.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/6/2009 Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Project Management Management of Medicare/Medicaid holdback process.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Project Management Manage post distribution activities.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
1/7/2009 Senior Management Respond to case correspondence.	3.25 200.00/hr	650.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	4.75 115.00/hr	546.25
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	3.00 125.00/hr	375.00
Project Management Management of Medicare/Medicaid holdback process.	3.25 125.00/hr	406.25
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Project Management Coordination of upcoming case phases.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Project Management Data audits of MLA email.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.25 40.00/hr	130.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and support.	0.25 115.00/hr	28.75
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	1.75 115.00/hr	201.25

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/7/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
1/8/2009 Project Management Manage case emails and issues.	4.25 125.00/hr	531.25
Senior Management Respond to case correspondence.	1.25 200.00/hr	250.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	3.75 125.00/hr	468.75
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.75 40.00/hr	230.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	29.87
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	7.50 115.00/hr	862.50
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	0.25 115.00/hr	28.75
1/9/2009 Distribution Services Distribution processing.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	5.00 125.00/hr	625.00
Senior Management Respond to case correspondence.	1.50 200.00/hr	300.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	7.50 115.00/hr	862.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.25 40.00/hr	290.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/9/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	0.75 115.00/hr	86.25
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	1.00 115.00/hr	115.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	0.75 115.00/hr	86.25
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
1/12/2009 Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	3.75 125.00/hr	468.75
Senior Management Respond to case correspondence.	1.75 200.00/hr	350.00
Project Management Manage case emails and issues.	0.25 125.00/hr	31.25
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	4.00 40.00/hr	160.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	4.75 40.00/hr	190.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	6.00 40.00/hr	240.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	8.75 40.00/hr	350.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.75 40.00/hr	190.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/12/2009 Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	3.75 40.00/hr	150.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	4.00 40.00/hr	160.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00
1/13/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00
Senior Management Conference call and follow-up	0.50 200.00/hr	100.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Project Management Attend phone conference / follow up reporting.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Accountant Attend phone conference.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.50 40.00/hr	220.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	5.00 125.00/hr	625.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Senior Management Respond to case correspondence.	2.25 200.00/hr	450.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/14/2009 Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	2.75 125.00/hr	343.75
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
Project Management Prepare for and attend phone conference with Garretson Firm.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	3.00 125.00/hr	375.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	2.50 40.00/hr	100.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	2.00 115.00/hr	230.00
Project Management Prepare for and attend phone conference with Garretson Firm and management of case emails and issues.	1.75 125.00/hr	218.75
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
1/15/2009 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	0.50 115.00/hr	57.50
Project Management Preparations for forthcoming distribution data.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Coordinate MLA pro se letters.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Provide requested reporting.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/15/2009 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	0.50 115.00/hr	57.50
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	1.25 40.00/hr	50.00
Project Management Manage case emails and issues.	0.75 125.00/hr	93.75
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	3.00 115.00/hr	345.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.25 40.00/hr	90.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.00 40.00/hr	80.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.75 40.00/hr	150.00
1/16/2009 Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Project Management Release MLA letters.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Receive and process distribution data.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	3.50 125.00/hr	437.50

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/16/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	3.00 115.00/hr	345.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
1/19/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Accountant Distribution support, account management and reconciliation.	7.50 125.00/hr	937.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	7.25 40.00/hr	290.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
1/20/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.50 40.00/hr	100.00
Accountant Distribution support, account management and reconciliation.	7.50 125.00/hr	937.50
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	5.25 40.00/hr	210.00
Project Management Data audits of law firm data in anticipation of next distribution.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	4.00 125.00/hr	500.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/21/2009 Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Project Management Coordinate check register for upcoming distribution.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Accountant Distribution support, account management and reconciliation.	6.25 125.00/hr	781.25
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	2.00 115.00/hr	230.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Project Management Manage case emails and issues.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.25 40.00/hr	130.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	3.50 125.00/hr	437.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Accountant Preparation of December 2008 Financial Reports.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
1/22/2009 Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Project Management Review and synthesis of deceased claimant reporting/individual issues.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/22/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Project Management Manage case emails and issues.	0.25 125.00/hr	31.25
Accountant Distribution support, account management and reconciliation.	3.75 125.00/hr	468.75
Systems Analyst/Programmer Check programming and application support.	3.00 115.00/hr	345.00
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	1.50 115.00/hr	172.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	3.00 125.00/hr	375.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
1/23/2009 Project Management Finalize and transmit distribution report for PSC approval.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.50 40.00/hr	100.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	3.00 125.00/hr	375.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/24/2009 Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	2.00 115.00/hr	230.00
1/26/2009 Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Project Management Manage case emails and issues.	1.50 125.00/hr	187.50
Systems Analyst/Programmer Application development, programming and reporting.	0.50 115.00/hr	57.50
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	4.25 40.00/hr	170.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
Project Management Review case IT issues.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Coordinate re-processing of recently deceased claimants.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	2.75 40.00/hr	110.00
1/27/2009 Systems Analyst/Programmer Administration of Client Access System.	1.00 115.00/hr	115.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.50 40.00/hr	100.00
Project Management Transmit updated SSN data to Garretson Firm.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Review case IT issues.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/27/2009 Project Management Prepare for and attend phone conference.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	2.25 125.00/hr	281.25
Accountant Attend phone conference.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.50 40.00/hr	140.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.75 40.00/hr	30.00
1/28/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
Project Management Preparing data for upcoming distribution.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Review case IT issues.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	2.25 40.00/hr	90.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	2.25 125.00/hr	281.25

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/28/2009 Claims Processing Prepare 1099's for mailing.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
1/29/2009 Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Project Management Review and release of 1099's.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.25 40.00/hr	10.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	3.00 40.00/hr	120.00
Claims Processing Transmission of passwords to law firms for Medicare/Medicaid reports.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	1.00 125.00/hr	125.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	2.50 40.00/hr	100.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	1.00 40.00/hr	40.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
1/30/2009 Distribution Services Distribution processing.	4.50 40.00/hr	180.00
Project Management Respond to attorney emails and elevated calls.	2.50 125.00/hr	312.50
Project Management Provide requested reporting to Garretson Firm.	0.50 125.00/hr	62.50

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/30/2009 Claims Processing Process received case materials.	3.25 40.00/hr	130.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	0.50 40.00/hr	20.00
Legal Counsel Attorney review of claims.	2.00 125.00/hr	250.00
Claims Processing Process received case materials.	1.50 40.00/hr	60.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	1.75 40.00/hr	70.00
Senior Management Respond to case correspondence.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
Distribution Services Distribution processing.	4.75 40.00/hr	190.00
Project Management Management of additional distribution.	0.25 125.00/hr	31.25
<b>For professional services rendered</b>	<b>461.00</b>	<b>\$37,997.37</b>

## Additional Charges :

1/6/2009 Fed Ex to Sheldon Schlesinger at Sheldon J Schlesinger PA	24.71
1/7/2009 Fed Ex to Darryl Booker	22.94
1/12/2009 Additional FedEx charges for December shipments to legal firms.	378.08
1/19/2009 Print letters to Pro Sec claimants - 272 pages @ \$0.50	136.00
Postage from Analytics Postage Meter to mail letters to Pro se claimants.	28.56
1/26/2009 Print letters to Pro Sec claimants - 4 @ \$0.50	2.00
Postage from Analytics Postage Meter to mail letters to Pro se claimants.	2.00
1/30/2009 Fax expense through January 2009 - 94 @ \$1.00	94.00
1/31/2009 Copies - January 2009 - 99 @ \$0.15 ea.	14.85
IVR charges for 800 toll free numbers - January 2009 \$100 per month minimum.	100.00

	<u>Amount</u>
1/31/2009 Print 1099 Tax Forms - 11 @ \$1.75	19.25
Postage from Analytics Postage Meter to mail 1099 tax forms.	4.62
<b>Total costs</b>	<u>\$827.01</u>
<b>Total amount of this bill</b>	<u>\$38,824.38</u>
<b>Previous balance</b>	<b>\$72,737.99</b>
2/4/2009 Payment - Thank You	<u>(\$72,737.99)</u>
<b>Total payments and adjustments</b>	<b>(\$72,737.99)</b>
Balance due	<u>\$38,824.38</u>