

		VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS	
03/13/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON, DIRECTED TO AL ALLENDE, REGARDING AMENDED SCF OF ANTHONY ANDREOTTOLA	0.10
03/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS	3.40
03/14/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ROGER BAUSER REGARDING ACCOUNTING MATTERS	0.50
03/14/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JEFF NELSON REGARDING ESCROW AGREEMENT	0.40
03/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON REGARDING JOINT WRITTEN DIRECTIVE	0.20
03/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RICHARD SIMMONS REGARDING JOINT WRITTEN DIRECTIVE	0.10
03/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS	1.10
03/17/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON REGARDING SUGGESTED CHANGES TO JOINT WRITTEN DIRECTIVE AND FORWARDING SAME	0.30
03/17/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING PROPOSED ORDER TO EXTENSION DEADLINE TO SUBMIT SUPPLEMENTAL DOCUMENTS TO APRIL 14, 2008	0.30
03/17/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS	1.70
03/17/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN	0.50
03/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CHRISTINE SANBORN OF AMERICAN LEGAL FUNDING REGARDING NOTICE OF LIEN PERTAINING TO EARNESTINE SCOTT	0.40
03/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MATT GARRETSON REGARDING GARRETSON FIRM INVOICE	0.20
03/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING GARRETSON FIRM INVOICE	0.10
03/18/08	PAJ	CONFERENCE CALL WITH COURT AND PARTIES	1.70
03/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF PAGE LIMIT FROM TODD & WELD REGARDING ROBERT MCKIM	0.40
03/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN APPROVING REQUEST FOR EXTENSION REGARDING CLAIM OF ROBERT MCKIM	0.10
03/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING FINAL ALLOCATION PLAN AND WHETHER OR NOT SAME SHOULD BE FILED UNDER SEAL	0.30
03/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON REGARDING CONFIDENTIALITY AND GUIDANT'S REQUEST THAT THE ALLOCATION PLAN BE FILED UNDER SEAL	0.20
03/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING FILING ALLOCATION PLAN UNDER SEAL WITH THE UNDERSTANDING THAT IT IS AVAILABLE TO PARTICIPATING COUNSEL	0.20
03/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON ADVISING OF NO OBJECTION TO THE GARRETSON LAW FIRM INVOICE	0.20
03/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RICHARD SIMMONS REGARDING FINANICAL REPORTING, PENDING DISBURSEMENTS, CLAIMS ADMINSTRATION FEE AND EXPENSE APPLICATIONS, SEGREGATION	1.40

		OF FUNDS AND FORWARDING REPORTS PERTAINING TO SAME	
03/19/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING GARRETSON LAW FIRM BILL AND CONTRACTUAL AGREEMENT BETWEEN GARRETSON AND PLC	0.20
03/19/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN	0.40
03/19/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ELIZABETH PETERSON	0.30
03/19/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ANDREW SHEN FORWARDING UPDATED SETTLEMENT TIMELINE WHICH HAS BEEN REVIEWED AND AGREED TO BY BOTH SIDES	0.40
03/19/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN ADVISING OF UNAVAILABILITY TO PARTICIPATE IN NEXT WEEK'S CONFERENCE CALL AND INQUIRING INTO WHETHER HE WILL GO FORTH WITH SAME	0.10
03/19/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING NEXT WEEK'S CONFERENCE CALL	0.20
03/19/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON INQUIRING INTO STATUS OF DECISIONS MADE ON REQUESTS FOR EXTENSION OF PAGE LIMIT PERTAINING TO SUPPLEMENTAL DOCUMENTATION	0.10
03/19/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO ROBERT SIMPSON GRANTING REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF PAGE LIMIT PERTAINING TO THEODORE EDWARD HOLL	0.20
03/19/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO HOWARD BUSHMAN GRANTING REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF PAGE LIMIT PERTAINING TO EUGENE CLASBY	0.20
03/19/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO DAWN CHMIELEWSKI GRANTING REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF PAGE LIMIT PERTAINING TO THELMA RUSSELL AND MICHAEL GARR	0.20
03/19/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO LAWRENCE KULLMAN GRANTING REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF PAGE LIMIT PERTAINING TO CLAIMANT WESTCOTT	0.20
03/19/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO RICHARD KOPELMAN GRANTING REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF PAGE LIMIT PERTAINING TO SAMUEL L. EDWARDS, SR., ALLEN HANDLEY AND JOHN L. MILLER, JR	0.20
03/19/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO CHRISTINE THOMPSON EMAIL GRANTING REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF PAGE LIMIT PERTAINING TO ROBERT MCKIM	0.20
03/19/08	PAR	TELEPHONE CALL FROM KATHY OF JUDGE BOYLAN'S OFFICE REGARDING FINAL ALLOCATION PLAN AND REQUESTING A COPY OF SAME	0.10
03/19/08	PAR	EMAIL TO KATHY OF JUDGE BOYLAN'S OFFICE FORWARDING FINAL VERSION OF ALLOCATION PLAN	0.10
03/19/08	PAR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH KATHY OF JUDGE BOYLAN'S OFFICE REGARDING ORDER TO APPROVE ALLOCATION PLAN	0.20
03/19/08	PAR	EMAIL TO KATHY OF JUDGE BOYLAN'S OFFICE REQUESTING COPY OF ORDER APPROVING ALLOCATION PLAN	0.10
03/19/08	PAR	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM KATHY OF JUDGE BOYLAN'S OFFICE FORWARDING ORDER TO APPROVE ALLOCATION WHICH NEEDS TO BE SIGNED	0.10
03/20/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM ATTORNEY DOUG SCHMIDT REQUESTING TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER THE COURT'S MEMORANDUM OPINION AND AMENDED ORDER REGARDING DETERMINATION OF COMMON BENEFIT ATTORNEYS FEES AMOUNT AND REASONABLE ASSESSMENT OF ATTORNEY FEE	0.40
03/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM OFFICE OF JOE POIROT FORWARDING NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF COUNSEL REGARDING CLAIM OF ROBERT SLAUGENHAUPT	0.20

001300	00796	Invoice # 17639	Page 22
03/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM OFFICE OF BARBARA WALLWEY FORWARDING PETITION TO SPECIAL MASTERS TO INCREASE ATTORNEY CONTINGENCY FEE	0.50
03/21/08	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ROGER BAUSER FORWARDING LIEN NOTICE FROM AMERICAN LEGAL FUNDING PERTAINING TO EARNESTINE SCOTT	0.30
03/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EXECUTED ORDER EXTENDING DEADLINE TO SUBMITT AMENDED SCF'S AND SUPPORTING DOCUMENTATION TO APRIL 14, 2008	0.10
03/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING SCF WITHDRAWALS FOR PAULINE CLARK AND DALE BARKER	0.20
03/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING CLAIM OF CHARLES EARLIN AND SUBMITTING AN EIF FOR SAME	0.30
03/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING MISSING PAGES TO RELEASES PERTAINING TO KENNETH NECAISE AND ROBERT WOMACK	0.10
03/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DEFENDANTS' OPPOSITION TO PLAINTIFFS' MOTIONS TO AMEND COMPLAINT AND ADD ADDITIONAL PARTIES	0.50
03/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF AFFIDAVIT OF TIMOTHY PRATT, WITH EXHIBTS, IN SUPPORT OF DEFENDANTS' OPPOSITION TO PLAINTIFFS' MOTION TO AMEND COMPLAINT AND ADD ADDITIONAL PARTIES	0.40
03/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RICHARD SIMMONS PROVIDING FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT UPDATE AND OPTIONS PERTAINING TO SAME	0.40
03/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM HENINGER, GARRISON & DAVIS REQUESTING PERMISSION TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER COURT'S ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEES	0.40
03/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MURPHY & ANDERSON REQUESTING PERMISSION TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER COURT'S ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEES	0.30
03/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM PALAZZO LAW FIRM REQUESTING PERMISSION TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER COURT'S ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEES	0.20
03/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM KAREN MESMER FORWARDING SCF WITHDRAWAL FOR BOBBY HARRIS	0.10
03/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF MINUTE ENTRY CONCERNING TODAY'S STATUS CONFERENCE	0.10
03/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MARTINEZ, MANGLARDI, DIEZ-ARGUELLES & TEJEDOR REQUESTING PERMISSION TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER COURT'S ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEES	0.40
03/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MORGAN & MORGAN REQUESTING PERMISSION TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER COURT'S ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEES	0.40
03/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM PARKER, WAICHMAN & ALONZO REQUESTING PERMISSION TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER COURT'S ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEES	0.30
03/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM THE MULLIGAN LAW FIRM REQUESTING PERMISSION TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER COURT'S ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEES	0.40
03/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM BURG SIMPSON LAW FIRM REQUESTING PERMISSION TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER	0.30

03/26/08	PAJ	COURT'S ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEES REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CORY WATSON FIRM REQUESTING PERMISSION TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER COURT'S ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEES	0.40
03/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM PLC REQUESTING PERMISSION TO VARIOUS PARTIES WITH SIMILAR INTERESTS TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER THE COURT'S ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEES AND FORWARDING STIPULATION PERTAINING TO SAME	0.60
03/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING LIEN CERTIFICATION PERTAINING TO MARY ANN MUDD	0.10
03/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF SUBSEQUENT EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING RELEASE OF MARY ANN MUDD	0.20
03/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JONATHAN REID OF ANALYTICS REGARDING ACCESS TO CLAIMS PROCESSING WEB APPLICATION AND FORWARDING DOCUMENT CONCERNING SAME	0.60
03/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON REGARDING FINAL LISTING OF 8550 CLAIMANTS, FORWARDING SAME AND ALSO FORWARDING LISTING CONTAINING DIFFERENCES	0.50
03/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING ADMINISTRATIVE BURDEN ON COURT ONCE CLAIMS APPEALS PROCESS BEGINS AND SETTING UP A TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO DISCUSS SAME	0.30
03/27/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN PROVIDING AVAILABILITY FOR A TELEPHONE CONFERENCE	0.10
03/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON REGARDING RELEASE ISSUES	0.40
03/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RICHARD ARSENAULT REGARDING SPECIFIC RELEASE QUESTIONS AND ISSUES	0.30
03/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF SUBSEQUENT EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON REGARDING RELEASE ISSUES	0.30
03/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON APPOINTMENT OF TRUSTEE INVOLVING DECEASED CLAIMANTS AND FORWARDING DRAFT DOCUMENTS CONCERNING SAME	0.70
03/27/08	PAJ	PREPARING INTIAL DRAFT OF PROTOCOL FOR SUBMISSION AND PAYMENT OF BILLS	0.80
03/28/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON AGREEING WITH OPTION TWO OF FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT SUGGESTION AND ADVISING THAT THE ESCROW AGREEMENT NEEDS TO BE AMENDED TO PERMIT ADDITIONAL SUB-ACCOUNTS TO BE OPENED	0.30
03/28/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF VARIOUS EMAILS FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON ADVISING OF PARTICULAR CLAIMANTS ELIGIBILITY TO PARTICIPATE IN THE SETTLEMENT PROCESS AND PROVIDING DEADLINES WHICH APPLY TO THE CLAIMS	1.40
03/28/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE A NOTICE OF APPEAL OF COURT'S MEMORANDUM OPINION AND AMENDED ORDER REGARDING COMMON BENEFIT ATTORNEY FEE AMOUNT	0.20
03/28/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF ORDER GRANTING EXTENSION OF TIME TO FILE NOTICE OF APPEAL OF COURT'S ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEES	0.20
03/28/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM JUDGE FRANK, DIRECTED TO JAMES LYMNA, REGARDING HIS ATTORNEYS FILING A MOTION TO	0.30

		WITHDRAW AND REQUESTING A RESPONSE TO SAME	
03/28/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM KOPELMAN LAW GROUP REQUESTING PERMISSION TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER THE COURT'S MEMORANDUM OPINION CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEE	0.40
03/28/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM ATTORNEY DOUGLAS M. SCHMIDT REQUESTING PERMISSION TO FILE A MOTION TO RECONSIDER THE COURT'S MEMORANDUM OPINION CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEE	0.30
03/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM OFFICE OF JOE POIROT FORWARDING NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF COUNSEL FOR PAUL WHALIN	0.20
03/31/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE FRANK AND JUDGE BOYLAN REQUESTING AVAILABLE DATES TOWARDS THE END OF JUNE FOR MEETING IN LOUISIANA TO DISCUSS ALLOCATIONS	0.20
03/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF ORDER DENYING NUMEROUS REQUESTS FOR MOTIONS TO RECONSIDER COURT'S ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEE AND EXHIBITS	0.50
03/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING AVAILABILITY FOR MEETING IN LOUISIANA AND SUGGESTING OTHER DATES	0.10
03/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING CONFERENCE CALL AT 2:00 THIS AFTERNOON AND PROVIDING CALL-IN NUMBER FOR SAME	0.10
03/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM KYLE LAKIN CONCERNING CLAIM OF ERIC FADNESS	0.30
03/31/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE FRANK AND JUDGE BOYLAN	0.50
03/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF MINUTE ENTRY REGARDING STATUS CONFERENCE HELD THIS MORNING WITH JUDGE FRANK AND SPECIAL MASTERS	0.10
03/31/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN	0.30
03/31/08	PAJ	PREPARING INITIAL DRAFT OF PROTOCOL FOR ATTORNEYS SEEKING INCREASE IN FEES	1.50
03/31/08	PAJ	REVISIONS TO DRAFT PROTOCOL FOR SUBMISISON AND PAYMENT OF BILLS	0.40
03/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON, DIRECTED TO LIEFF CABRASER FIRM, REGARDING DECLARATION SUBMISSIONS	0.20
03/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF MINUTE ENTRY REGARDING STATUS CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN	0.10
03/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING NOTICES OF WITHDRAWAL OF ROBERT BINSTOCK AS COUNSEL FOR BRENDA BONAFIELD, ROBERT FLEMMING AND ELIZABETH DUNBAR	0.30
03/31/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN, ANALYTICS, PLAINTIFF COUNSEL AND DEFENSE COUNSEL FORWARDING DRAFT PROTOCOL FOR SUBMISSION AND PAYMENT OF BILLS WITH A REQUEST FOR COMMENTS ON SAME	0.20
03/31/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN FORWARDING DRAFT PROTOCOL AND PROCEDURE FOR ATTORNEYS SEEKING INCREASE IN ATTORNEY FEES WITH A REQUEST FOR COMMENTS ON SAME	0.30
03/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF JOHN DAVID HART AS COUNSEL FOR ANDREW HANSHAW	0.10

001300	00796		Invoice # 17639	Page 25
03/31/08	PAR	PROCESSING SETTLEMENT CONSIDERATION FORMS AND SUPPLEMENTAL DOCUMENTATION - MONTH OF MARCH		61.00
				\$97,390.00
PAJ	JUNEAU, PATRICK A.	258.00 hrs @	\$350.00 /hr	\$90,300.00
PAR	PARALEGAL	141.80 hrs @	\$50.00 /hr	\$7,090.00
	Fee Recap Totals	<u>399.80</u>		<u>\$97,390.00</u>

EXPENSES

Amount

12/16/07	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; AIRFARE - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	335.60
12/16/07	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; TAXI - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	35.00
12/16/07	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	28.60
12/17/07	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; TAXI - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	20.00
12/17/07	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	31.55
12/18/07	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; TAXI - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	35.00
12/18/07	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; AIRPORT PARKING - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	24.00
12/18/07	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; HOTEL - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	651.34
12/18/07	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	45.40
01/25/08	FEDERAL EXPRESS; DELIVERY SERVICE/MESSENGERS	23.95
01/25/08	FEDERAL EXPRESS; DELIVERY SERVICE/MESSENGERS	23.95
01/25/08	FEDERAL EXPRESS; DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT	21.53
01/25/08	A T & T; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE HELD 12/27/07	450.63
01/31/08	EXPENSES FOR JANUARY - 1 TONER CARTRIDGE (\$98.95), 12 PACKS OF PAPER (\$79.08)	178.03
02/19/08	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; AIRFARE - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	608.00
02/19/08	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; TAXI - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	35.00
02/19/08	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	27.50
02/20/08	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; AIRPORT PARKING - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	16.00
02/20/08	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; HOTEL - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	330.14
02/20/08	PATRICK A JUNEAU, JR; MEALS - MINNEAPOLIS, MN	21.50
02/29/08	EXPENSES FOR FEBRUARY - 2 TONER CARTRIDGES(\$197.90), 18 PACKS OF PAPER(\$118.62)	316.52
03/04/08	FEDERAL EXPRESS; DELIVERY SERVICE/MESSENGERS	36.09
03/04/08	FEDERAL EXPRESS; DELIVERY SERVICE/MESSENGERS	36.09
03/04/08	A T & T; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE HELD 1/15/08	438.61
03/04/08	A T & T; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE HELD 1/22/08	151.13
03/18/08	A T & T; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE HELD 2/12/08	235.86
03/18/08	A T & T; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE HELD 2/26/08	215.23
03/31/08	COPYING	1,794.60
03/31/08	FACSIMILE	3.15
03/31/08	LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE CHARGE	315.33
03/31/08	EXPENSES FOR MARCH - 3 TONER CARTRIDGES(\$296.85), 24 PACKS OF PAPER(\$158.16)	455.01
03/31/08	POSTAGE CHARGE	6.14
		<u>\$6,946.48</u>

Expense Recap Totals

\$6,946.48

BILLING SUMMARY:

TOTAL FEES

\$97,390.00

TOTAL EXPENSES

\$6,946.48

TOTAL FEES & EXPENSES

\$104,336.48

TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE

\$104,336.48