

		GARRETSON, WENDY FLEISHMAN AND SILVIJA STRIKIS BE INCLUDED ON THE WEEKLY CALLS	
01/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM AMY INSLER REGARDING REPRESENTATION OF SONIA URRIOLA	0.20
01/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ROGER BAUSER REGARDING BINDER CONTAINING LIEN INFORMATION	0.10
01/22/08	PAJ	CONFERENCE CALL WITH PARTIES AND JUDGE BOYLAN	0.30
01/23/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RICHARD ARSENAULT REGARDING MOVING SUPPLEMENTAL DEADLINE TO MARCH 28, 2008	0.10
01/23/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MATT GARRETSON REGARDING MEETING TO DISCUSS MEDICARE AND ALLOCATION SYSTEM	0.20
01/23/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING SUPPLEMENTATION PROTOCL AND PROTOCL FOR SUBMISSIONS OVER 30 PAGES	0.40
01/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON, DIRECTED TO STEVEN LEWIS REGARDING CLAIM OF KENNETH NEISCHLOSS	0.20
01/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM J. RICE FERRELLE FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.30
01/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JOE DILORENZO FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION FOR DAVID EMERSON	0.20
01/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM BRENDA FULMER FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION WITH LISTING OF CLIENTS	0.40
01/24/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ROBERT CHURELLA FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
01/25/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO COUNSEL CONCERNING PUSHING BACK THE DATE TO PROVIDE SUPPLEMENTAL INFORMATION TO MARCH 28, 2008	0.20
01/25/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MATT GARRETSON CONCERNING MEETING TO DISCUSS ISSUES	0.40
01/25/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN	0.20
01/25/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO MATT GARRETSON REGARDING MEETING ON FEBRUARY 8, 2008 TO DISCUSS MEDICARE INQUIRIES	0.20
01/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MATT GARRETSON REGARDING SCHEDULING MEETING	0.20
01/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM OFFICE OF TODD & WELD FORWRDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.30
01/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RAY BERK FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
01/28/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MATT GARRETSON ADVISING OF CONFLICT WITH FEBRUARY 8TH MEETING DATE AND PROVIDING ADDITIONAL DATES	0.20
01/28/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN INQUIRING INTO ADDITIONAL AVAILABLE DATES TO MEET WITH MEDICARE	0.20
01/28/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO MATT GARRETSON ADVISING OF FEBRUARY 19, 2008 TO MEET WITH JUDGE BOYLAN AND MEDICARE	0.10
01/28/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MCMAHAN LAW FIRM FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
01/29/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ROS ESTEFAN FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION WITH LISTING OF CLIENTS	0.30
01/29/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ALL PARTIES AND COURT	0.50
01/29/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JONATHAN REID OF ANALYTICS	0.20

		REQUESTING APPROVAL OF EMAIL SIGNATURE FOR EMAILS TO BE SENT	
01/29/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING FILING OF MOTION TO WITHDRAW COUNSEL	0.10
01/29/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MATT GARRETSON CONFIRMING AVAILABILITY FOR FEBRUARY 19TH MEETING IN MINNEAPOLIS	0.10
01/29/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN CONFIRMING THE FEBRUARY 19TH MEETING IN MINNEAPOLIS	0.10
01/29/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM AMERICAN LEGAL FOUNDATION PROVIDING NOTICE OF LIEN CONCERNING REYNA COWAN AND FORWARDING DOCUMENTS REGARDING SAME	0.40
01/30/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JONATHAN REID OF ANALYTICS CONFIRMING THAT THE EMAIL TO ATTORNEYS REGARDING MEDICARE/MEDICAID LIEN ISSUE WAS SENT AND FORWARDING COPY OF WHAT WAS SENT	0.50
01/30/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING WITHDRAWALS OF SCF FOR JOANNE JAMES AND WILLIAM HALL	0.30
01/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM FAITH FAIELLA REGARDING RECENT SCF'S	0.10
01/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION FROM ADAM KARCHMAR	0.20
01/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON, DIRECTED TO FAITH FAIELLA, REGARDING ADDITIONAL SCF'S	0.20
01/31/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH NEIL OVERHOLTZ	0.50
01/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM OFFICE OF CHARLES JOHNSON & ASSOCIATES REGARDING WITHDRAWAL OF SCF FOR JAMES PACE	0.20
01/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM SUSAN WATERS FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION AND LISTING OF CLIENTS	0.30
01/31/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM TODD BROWN FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
01/31/08	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ROGER BAUSER REGARDING NOTICE OF LIEN ON REYNA COWAN	0.30
01/31/08	PAR	PROCESSING SETTLEMENT CONSIDERATION FORMS AND SUPPLEMENTAL DOCUMENTATION - MONTH OF JANUARY	32.00
02/01/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM OFFICE OF O'CONNOR, ACCIANI & LEVY FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/01/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL PROTOCOL AND POSSIBLY FILING SAME SOON	0.30
02/01/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ROGER BAUSER REGARDING ADMINISTRATIVE BILLING	0.20
02/01/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING MEETING ON FEBRUARY 5TH IN ATTEMPT TO RESOLVE COMMON BENEFIT ISSUE	0.20
02/01/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELLIOT OLSEN FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION WITH LISTING OF CLIENTS	0.30
02/04/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN ADVISING THAT AN ORDER WILL BE ISSUED REGARDING COMMON BENEFIT ISSUE	0.10
02/04/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM GEOFFREY GIFFORD FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/04/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JAY CALVERT COOPER FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/04/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO ROGER BAUSER REGARDING ADMINISTRATIVE BILLING	0.10

02/04/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL PROTOCOL	0.20
02/04/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ROGER BAUSER CONFIRMING RECEIPT OF LIEN NOTICE PERTAINING TO REYNA COWAN AND ADVISING OF NOTATION OF SAME	0.10
02/06/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM KAREN WRIGHT FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/06/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JULIE BROWN FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.30
02/06/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MICHAEL GALLANT FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/06/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM OFFICE OF DAVID WILLIAMS FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.10
02/06/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RICHARD ARSENAULT REGARDING FEE RELATED MEDIATION SESSIONS AND ORDER ISSUED REQUESTING ADDITIONAL DATA	0.20
02/06/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF SUBSEQUENT EMAIL FROM RICHARD ARSENAULT FORWARDING ORDER ISSUED BY JUDGE FRANK REGARDING COMMON BENEFIT FEES AND ADDITIONAL INFORMATION	0.30
02/08/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING SUPPLEMENTATION PROTOCOL	0.30
02/08/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM KIM SHERWOOD FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/08/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ARNOLD DIJOSEPH FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION WITH LISTING OF CLIENTS	0.30
02/11/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RICHARD ARSENAULT REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL	0.50
02/11/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM EDWARD FIORELLA FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/11/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM STEPHEN RANDALL FORWARDING SUBMISSION PURSUANT TO FEBRUARY 4TH ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FEES	0.30
02/11/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE FRANK	0.50
02/11/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ANDREW GOLOBOY FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/11/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM DANIELLE MAIR, DIRECTED TO OFFICE OF STEPHEN RANDALL, ADVISING THAT THEIR SUBMISSION MUST BE FILED ELECTRONICALLY AND UNDER SEAL	0.10
02/11/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE FRANK REGARDING STATUS	0.10
02/12/08	PAJ	CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE BOYLAN AND PARTIES	0.50
02/12/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING REVISED SUPPLEMENTATION PROTOCOL AND COVERSHEETS	0.40
02/13/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN	0.40
02/13/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE FRANK REGARDING COMMITTEE FOR COMMON BENEFIT FEE ISSUE	0.20
02/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF FAX FROM JUDGE BOYLAN FORWARDING EXECUTED IMPLEMENTATION OF SETTLEMENT CONSIDERATION FORM SUPPLEMENTATION PROTOCOL	0.20
02/14/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN APPROVING SUPPLEMENTATION PROTOCOL	0.10
02/14/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE FRANK	0.50

001300	00796	Invoice # 17639	Page 13
02/14/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE FRANK AND JUDGE BOYLAN	0.70
02/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON, DIRECTED TO DIANE CUMMINGS, REQUESTING DOCUMENTATION OF AUTHORITY FOR SEBASTIAN CATALANO TO SIGN A DECLARATION/RELEASE	0.20
02/14/08	PAJ	PREPARATION OF AUTHORIZATION TO PAY FEES AND EXPENSES OF CLAIMS ADMINISTRATOR	0.30
02/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM KAREN MESMER FORWARDING WITHDRAWAL OF SCF FOR GARY COMBS AND SHARON BROWNE	0.30
02/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM THE ALVAREZ LAW FIRM FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION WITH LISTING OF CLIENTS	0.30
02/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LARRY CENTOLA FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM OFFICE OF WALLACE AND GRAHAM FORWARDING VARIOUS DECLARATIONS OF PARTICIPATION	0.40
02/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING AUTHORIZATION FOR SIGNED CLAIMANTS' RELEASES	0.20
02/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DRAFT ORDER REGARDING COMMON BENEFIT FEES	0.50
02/14/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING COMMON BENEFIT ISSUE AND DRAFT ORDER CONCERNING SAME	0.40
02/14/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ROGER BAUSER FORWARDING ANALYTICS INVOICE FOR SERVICES WITH REQUEST FOR APPROVAL OF SAME	0.40
02/15/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN AND JUDGE FRANK	0.40
02/15/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JOSEPH MARCAL FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.10
02/15/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE FRANK REGARDING ALLOCATION COMMITTEE, CONTINGENCY FEES AND FORWARDING FINAL DRAFT OF ORDER CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT FUND	0.60
02/15/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING FINAL DRAFT ORDER AND SUGGESTING A CONFERENCE CALL TO DISCUSS SAME PRIOR TO FILING	0.20
02/15/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN AND MATT GARRETSON	0.10
02/15/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN	0.30
02/15/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON, DIRECTED TO JOSEPH MARCAL, REGARDING RECENTLY SUBMITTED DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/15/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RICHARD ARSENAULT FORWARDING ORDER CONCERNING ATTORNEYS FEES	0.30
02/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON FORWARDING AGREED UPON CONFIDENTIAL RELEASE, INDEMNITY AND ASSIGNMENT	1.40
02/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ATTORNEY MICHAEL TERWILLIGER REGARDING NECESSARY FORMS AND INFORMATION NEEDED FOR PARTICIPATION IN SETTLEMENT	0.30
02/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM WENDY FLEISHMAN REGARDING PREPARATION OF FORM CERTIFYING THAT THE CLIENT HAS NO OPEN LINES	0.20
02/18/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MARK DANA FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/19/08	PAJ	TRAVEL TO MINNEAPOLIS, CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN AND LIEN ADMINISTRATOR AND SUBSEQUENT CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE FRANK, JUDGE BOYLAN AND MEMBERS OF THE PLC	10.00

001300	00796	Invoice # 17639	Page 14
02/20/08	PAJ	CONFERENCE WITH COURT AND RETURN TO LOUISIANA	7.00
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM NEIL OVERHOLTZ REGARDING ALLOCATION PLAN MODIFICATIONS	0.30
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM JEFF NELSON FORWARDING COMPLETE AND FINAL VERSION OF MSA WITH ALL EXHIBITS	0.60
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM DIANNE WALLWEY FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF SUBSEQUENT EMAIL FROM DIANNE WALLWEY FORWRDING CLAIMANTS DECLARATION AND STIPULATION OF DISMISSAL	0.20
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM THE BRANDI LAW FIRM FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM HERSH & HERSH FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTCIPATION WITH LISTING OF CLIENTS	0.30
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RYAN YAGODA FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.20
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CHARLES BAILEY FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION WITH LISTING OF CLIENTS	0.30
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION WITH LISTING OF CLIENTS ON BEHALF OF LIEFF, CABRASER, HEIMANN & BERNSTEIN	0.30
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION AND LISTING OF CLIENTS ON BEHALF OF MARTIN & JONES	0.20
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF DOMINA LAW GROUP	0.10
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION AND LISTING OF CLIENTS ON BEHALF OF ZIMMERMAN REED	0.30
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION AND LISTING OF CLIENTS ON BEHALF OF KENNETH ALLEN & ASSOCIATES	0.20
02/21/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF REICH AND BINSTOCK	0.10
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATIONS FOR CAREY & DANIS AND THE LOWE LAW FIRM	0.30
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ABRAM BOHRER FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.30
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION FOR HOLLIS LAW FIRM	0.20
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM HERSH & HERSH FORWARDING REVISED DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION	0.10
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LUNDY & DAVIS FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION WITH LISTING OF CLIENTS	0.30
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM NEIL OVERHOLTZ REGARDING ALLOCATION RECOMMENDATIONS AND FORWARDING REVISED ALLOCATION PLAN	0.50
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF SUBSEQUENT EMAIL FROM NEIL OVERHOLTZ REGARDING ALLOCATION PLAN	0.10
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF COUNSEL'S DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION, CLAIMANT'S DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION, RELEASE AND STIPULATION AND DISMISSAL ON BEHALF OF CLAIMANT LISA BULTENA AND OFFICE OF JOHNSON & CHRISTENSEN	0.40
02/22/08	PAJ	SUBSEQUENT TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN	0.30

001300	00796		Invoice # 17639	Page 15
02/22/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE FRANK REGARDING RECOMMENDATIONS CONCERNING THE ATTORNEY CONTINGENCY FEE		0.30
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION FROM CHARLES JOHNSON & ASSOCIATES, ALONG WITH LISTING OF CLAIMANTS		0.30
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF AMENDED LIST OF CLIENTS FROM HOLLIS LAW FIRM		0.10
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION FROM HUBBARD & KNIGHT		0.20
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CURTIS WATKINS FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION FOR JOHN PARSONS		0.20
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JOHNSON & CHRISTENSEN LAW OFFICE FORWARDING REVISED STIPULATION AND DISMISSAL		0.10
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF THE BERTRAM LAW FIRM		0.10
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING STIPULATION TO JOHNSON & CHRISTENSEN LAW OFFICE		0.10
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM LAW OFFICE OF JOHNSON & CHRISTENSEN FORWARDING EXECUTED STIPULATION OF DISMISSAL		0.10
02/22/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE FRANK'S OFFICE FORWARDING DRAFT SECTION OF ORDER REGARDING ATTORNEY CONTINGENCY FEE WITH A REQUEST FOR COMMENTS ON SAME		0.40
02/22/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING ATTORNEY CONTINGENCY FEE		0.40
02/25/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN		0.30
02/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF ATTORNEY JOHN PENTZ FOR WARREN WITTEICH		0.10
02/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM OFFICE OF NOVAK ROBENALT & PAVLIK FORWARDING COUNSEL'S DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION, RELEASE AND CLAIMANT'S DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION		0.40
02/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION AND LISTING OF CLAIMANTS ON BEHALF OF OSHMAN & MIRISOLA		0.30
02/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MARK WEST FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF DOROTHY STANDLEY		0.20
02/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF F. PAIGE GAMBLE		0.20
02/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM DONALD ALEXANDER REGARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION, PRO SE CLAIMANT'S DECLARATION, RELEASE, STIPULATION OF DISMISSAL AND CLAIM INFORMATION		0.30
02/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JULIE GREEN FORWARDING CLAIMANT'S DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF SARAH MARTIN		0.10
02/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION AND LISTING OF CLIENTS ON BEHALF OF HOLLIS LAW FIRM		0.30
02/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION AND LISTING OF CLIENTS ON BEHALF OF REINER, SIMPSON AND SLAUGHTER LAW FIRM		0.30
02/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION AND LISTING OF CLIENTS ON BEHALF OF IRPINO LAW FIRM		0.20
02/25/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF MATHESON, MORTENSEN, OLSEN & JEPPSON LAW FIRM		0.10
02/26/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PARTIES AND COURT		0.40

001300	00796		Invoice # 17639	Page 16
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION SUBMITTED ON BEHALF OF OSHMAN & MIRISOLA		0.10
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF GALEX WOLF LAW FIRM		0.10
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM OFFICE OF DAVID MARSHALL FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION AND LISTING OF CLIENTS		0.30
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION AND LISTING OF CLIENTS ON BEHALF OF ANAPOL, SCHWARTZ, WEISS, COHAN, FELDMAN & SMALLEY LAW FIRM		0.30
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF BARRY LANG LAW FIRM		0.10
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF PIPER & ASSOCIATES		0.20
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF BRASSEL, BALDWIN, KAGAN & MAY LAW FIRM		0.10
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM THE SCHMIDT FIRM FORWARDING DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION AND LISTING OF CLIENTS		0.30
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION AND LISTING OF CLIENTS ON BEHALF OF CORY, WATSON, CROWDER & DEGARIS		0.40
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF PALAZZO LAW FIRM		0.20
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF KNISBACHER LAW FIRM		0.10
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF LEWIS, KULLMAN, STERBCOW & ABRAMSON LAW FIRM		0.10
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF MARRIOTT, CALLAHAN, BLAIR, GREER & BONGIOVANNI		0.10
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM MARCUS STEVENSON FORWARDING CLAIMANT DECLARATIONS OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF NUMEROUS CLIENTS		0.30
02/26/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION ON BEHALF OF THE JOHNSON LAW FIRM		0.10
02/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON ADVISING OF MAILING OF SECOND NOTEBOOK CONTAINING ADDITIONAL LIEN INFORMATION		0.20
02/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON, DIRECTED TO NICHOLAS LASTRA, FORWARDING CORRECT FORM FOR DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION		0.10
02/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING CHANGES TO ALLOCATION PLAN, IN PARTICULAR CONCERNING COMMON BENEFIT ATTORNEY FEE, AND FORWARDING REVISED PLAN		0.60
02/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM NEIL OVERHOLTZ REGARDING REVISED ALLOCATION PLAN		0.10
02/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS OF PARTICIPATION FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL		3.90
02/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON REGARDING MODIFICATIONS TO LIST OF 8550 CLAIMANTS AND FORWARDING UPDATED LISTING OF SAME AS WELL AS LISTING CONTAINING DIFFERENCES		0.40

001300	00796		Invoice # 17639	Page 17
02/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON, DIRECTED TO OFFICE OF KAY VAN WEY, REGARDING REPRESENTATION OF CHRISTOPHER BAKER		0.10
02/27/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON ADVISING OF PARTICULAR CLAIMANTS ELIGIBLE TO PARTICIPATE IN THE SETTLEMENT PROCESS AND PROVIDING DEADLINES WHICH APPLY TO THE CLAIMS		0.40
02/28/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAILS FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON ADVISING OF PARTICULAR CLAIMANTS ELIGIBLE TO PARTICIPATE IN THE SETTLEMENT PROCESS AND PROVIDING DEADLINES WHICH APPLY TO THE CLAIMS		1.60
02/28/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS OF PARTICIPATION FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS		4.70
02/29/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM CHARLES ZIMMERMAN PROVIDING ON BEHALF OF THE CBAFCC PROPOSED PROCEDURES, PROTOCOLS AND GUIDELINES FOR ALLOCATION, ALONG WITH MONTHLY TIME SHEET, TIME REPORT AND EXPENSE REPORT		1.30
02/29/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS OF PARTICIPATION FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS		4.60
02/29/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON REGARDING ISSUES CONCERNING RELEASES AND DECEASED CLAIMANTS AND FORWARDING OUTLINE CONCERNING SAME		0.40
02/29/08	PAR	PROCESSING SETTLEMENT CONSIDERATION FORMS AND SUPPLEMENTAL DOCUMENTATION - MONTH OF FEBRUARY		47.00
03/01/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS OF PARTICIPATION FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS		2.30
03/02/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS OF PARTICIPATION FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS		2.70
03/03/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING ISSUES RELATING TO RELEASES AND DECEASED CLAIMANTS		0.30
03/03/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON REGARDING ISSUE CONCERNING RELEASES AND DECEASED CLAIMANTS		0.40
03/03/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING PROTOCOL ON HOW TO APPLY EXEMPTION FROM THE 30 PAGE LIMIT ON SUPPLEMENTAL DOCUMENTS		0.20
03/03/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM NEIL OVERHOLTZ REGARDING REQUEST FOR SUBMISSIONS OVER 30 PAGES		0.20
03/03/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS OF PARTICIPATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND FIRMS		5.50
03/04/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT AND PARTIES		0.90
03/04/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING REQUEST FOR AN EXTENSION OF THE 30 PAGE LIMIT FROM ATTORNEY ROBERT SIMPSON PERTAINING TO THE CLAIM OF THEODORE EDWARD HOLL		0.30
03/04/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF 30 PAGE LIMIT FROM ATTORNEY HOWARD BUSHMAN REGARDING CLAIM OF EUGENE CLASBY		0.50
03/04/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF 30 PAGE LIMIT FROM ATTORNEY DAWN CHMIELEWSKI PERTAINING TO CLAIM OF THELMA RUSSELL		0.20
03/04/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING		0.30

		REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF 30 PAGE LIMIT FROM ATTORNEY LARRY KULLMAN PERTAINING TO THE CLAIM OF WESTCOTT	
03/04/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RICHARD ARSENAULT PROVIDING UPDATE ON NUMBER OF DECLARATIONS RECEIVED AS WELL AS OUTSTANDING DECLARATIONS	0.40
03/04/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON FORWARDING REQUEST TO EXCEED 30 PAGE LIMIT FROM ATTORNEY RICHARD KOPELMAN ON BEHALF OF SAMUEL EDWARDS, ALLEN HANDLEY AND JOHN MILLER	0.50
03/04/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS OF PARTICIPATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND FIRMS	4.60
03/05/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON REGARDING REQUEST FROM HERSH & HERSH CONCERNING SUBMISSION ON CD AND ADVISING THAT THEY WOULD PREFER SUBMISSION BY EMAIL	0.30
03/05/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REGARDING REQUEST FROM HERSH & HERSH TO SEND CLIENTS' SUBMISSIONS ON CD/DVD	0.20
03/05/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS OF PARTICIPATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND FIRMS	5.20
03/06/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RICHARD ARSENAULT	0.30
03/06/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON, DIRECTED TO CYNTHIA WALTERS, ADVISING THAT HER DECLARATION OF PARTICIPATION WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED DUE TO ADDITION ON SIGNATURE PAGE OF SAME	0.30
03/06/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS OF PARTICIPATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND FIRMS	4.10
03/06/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RICHARD ARSENAULT REGARDING REMAINING ATTORNEYS TO PROVIDE DECLARATIONS BY MARCH 14, 2008, ASSUMING AN ORDER IS SIGNED	0.20
03/06/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RICHARD ARSENAULT FORWARDING A PROPOSED ORDER TO JUDGE BOYLAN CONCERNING DEADLINE TO SUBMIT DECLARATIONS OF PARTICIPATION	0.30
03/06/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON REQUESTING THAT ORDER FOR DEADLINE TO SUBMIT DECLARATIONS NOT BE SIGNED DUE TO LARGER AMOUNT OF REMAINING LAWYERS TO SUBMIT	0.20
03/06/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JEFF NELSON REGARDING STATUS OF COUNSEL DECLARATIONS AND PROVIDING NUMBERS ON WHAT IS STILL OUTSTANDING	0.40
03/06/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING REQUESTS FOR EXTENSION OF PAGE LIMIT	0.30
03/06/08	PAJ	CORRESPONDENCE TO ROGER BAUSER OF ANALYTICS FORWARDING REQUESTS FOR EXTENSION OF PAGE LIMIT	0.40
03/07/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ATTORNEY HUNTER SHKOLNIK FORWARDING PROPOSED LIEN DECLARATION FORM WITH REQUEST FOR COMMENTS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO DISCUSS SAME	0.40
03/07/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ANDREW SHEN FORWARDING FINAL CERTIFICATION REGARDING NON-MEDICARE AND NON-MEDICAID LIENS	0.30
03/07/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ROGER BAUSER REGARDING PAYMENT OF ANALYTICS INVOICE AND TIMING OF TRANSFERRING MONEY FOR SAME	0.20

001300	00796		Invoice # 17639	Page 19
03/07/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING PAYMENT OF ANALYTICS INVOICE AND REVIEW OF SAME BY PARTIES AND TRANSFERRING MONEY		0.30
03/07/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS		4.90
03/08/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS		2.70
03/09/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS		2.10
03/10/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE FRANK ADVISING OF FILING OF DECISION ON ATTORNEY FEES		0.10
03/10/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RICHARD ARSENAULT FORWARDING LENGTHY MEMORANDUM OPINION ON ATTORNEYS FEES		0.80
03/10/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN FORWARDING DRAFT FORM CONCERNING LIEN DECLARATION WITH REQUEST FOR APPROVAL OF SAME		0.20
03/10/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING LIEN DECLARATION FORM AND GUIDANT REVIEWING SAME		0.30
03/10/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN FORWARDING REVISED LIEN DECLARATION FORM AND ADVISING THAT PARTIES HAVE AGREED TO SAME		0.30
03/10/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING UNAVAILABILITY TO PARTICIPATE IN TOMORROW'S CONFERENCE CALL		0.10
03/10/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN REGARDING REVISED PROPOSED ALLOCATION PLAN		0.30
03/10/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS		1.40
03/11/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO DANIELLE MAIR FORWARDING FINAL REVISED ALLOCATION PLAN		0.20
03/11/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ALL PARTIES		0.80
03/11/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ROGER BAUSER REGARDING FINANCIAL REPORTING AND INQUIRING INTO HOW SAME SHOULD BE HANDLED		0.30
03/11/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM SILVIJA STRIKIS FORWARDING CORRESPONDENCE THAT RAISE AN ISSUE OF CONCERN TO CLAIMANTS IN THE SETTLEMENT ADMINISTRATION		0.40
03/11/08	PAJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RICHARD ARSENAULT		0.20
03/11/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS		1.90
03/12/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM RICHARD SIMMONS REGARDING PROPOSED STRUCTURE TO FINANCIAL REPORTING AND DISBURSEMENTS		0.40
03/12/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF EMAIL FROM ELIZABETH PETERSON, DIRECTED TO RICHARD KOPELMAN, REGARDING CONCERNS REGARDING REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF PAGE LIMIT		0.40
03/12/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS AND RELEASES FROM VARIOUS COUNSEL AND LAW FIRMS		4.20
03/12/08	PAJ	EMAIL TO JUDGE BOYLAN PROVIDING SUMMARY OF TELEPHONE CONFERENCE HELD ON MARCH 11, 2008		0.40
03/13/08	PAJ	REVIEW OF NUMEROUS DECLARATIONS AND RELEASES FROM		3.10